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Risyandi Risyandi <drg.risyandi@unimus.ac.id>
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SUSI <sukmasari@iium.edu.my> Tue, Nov 7, 2023 at 9:15 AM
To: "drg.risyandi@unimus.ac.id" <drg.risyandi@unimus.ac.id>

---------- Forwarded message ---------
From: SUSI <sukmasari@iium.edu.my>
Date: Fri, Mar 25, 2022 at 8:11 AM
Subject: Re: 108642-PJBS-ANSI - Request for Revised Article
To: Science Alert <support@scialert.com>

On Thu, Mar 24, 2022 at 1:16 AM Science Alert <support@scialert.com> wrote:

Dear Dr. Susi Sukmasari

This is with regard to your submitted manuscript, 108642-PJBS-ANSI, titled Antimicrobial activity of Î²-
sitosterol isolated from Kalanchoe tomentosa leaves against Staphylococcus aureus and Klebsiella 
pneumonia, submitted to Pakistan Journal of Biological Sciences on 02 February, 2022 for consideration as a 
Research Article.

The article has been accepted for publication after revision. A Peer Review report is available online and you 
can access this report after log in to your account with User ID: sukmasari@iium.edu.my. 

If you have forgot your password, you may retrieve your password from the following link by providing your 
User ID sukmasari@iium.edu.my.
  
http://scialert.com/forgot_password.php

It is therefore, requested to please submit revised version of your article urgently for further processing. 

Please let us know when we can expect the revised version of your manuscript. 

We look forward to hearing from you.

Regard
Academic Editor
Pakistan Journal of Biological Sciences

--

Dear Editor,

Thank you for the acceptance. We are on going to revise the manusript and submit soon.

Regards,
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Asst. Prof. Susi Sukmasari
PDPH Department-Kulliyah of Dentistry
International Islamic University Malaysia
Jl. Sultan Ahmad Shah
Kuantan 
Pahang
Tlp.+60179040567, ext: 4898

--

السلام علیكم و رحمة الله و بركات ه

Regards,

Asst. Prof. Susi Sukmasari
PDPH Department-Kulliyah of Dentistry
International Islamic University Malaysia
Jl. Sultan Ahmad Shah
Kuantan 
Pahang
Tlp.+60179040567, ext: 4898
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SUSI <sukmasari@iium.edu.my> Tue, Nov 7, 2023 at 9:28 AM
To: "drg.risyandi@unimus.ac.id" <drg.risyandi@unimus.ac.id>

---------- Forwarded message ---------
From: Science Alert <support@scialert.com>
Date: Thu, Jun 2, 2022 at 7:03 PM
Subject: 108642-PJBS-ANSI - Check Final Proof
To: Susi Sukmasari <sukmasari@iium.edu.my>

Dear Dr. Susi Sukmasari

This is with regard to your submitted manuscript, 108642-PJBS-ANSI, titled Antimicrobial activity of Î²-
sitosterol isolated from Kalanchoe tomentosa leaves against Staphylococcus aureus and Klebsiella 
pneumonia, submitted to Pakistan Journal of Biological Sciences on 02 February, 2022 for consideration as a 
Research Article.

Production Department has prepared final proof of your above mentioned manuscript for publication in the 
coming issue of Pakistan Journal of Biological Sciences. 

You may please download the final proof of your article for final checking after log in to your account with 
User ID: sukmasari@iium.edu.my. 

If you have forgot your password, you may retrieve your password from the following link by providing your 
User ID sukmasari@iium.edu.my.
  
http://scialert.com/forgot_password.php

Please check the final proof carefully and provide us the list of corrections by replying this email. Please note 
that after this step this article will be published immediately and we will not be in a position to modify any part 
of the paper later on. 

It is therefore, requested to please submit list of corrections within next two days. If the provided final proof is 
suitable and you did not find any mistake in this final proof, please send us email and write that you are 
satisfied with the provided final proof. 

Your quick response will help us to publish your article in the coming issue. 

We look forward to hearing from you.

Regard
Academic Editor
Pakistan Journal of Biological Sciences

--

السلام علیكم و رحمة الله و بركات ه
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Regards,

Asst. Prof. Susi Sukmasari
PDPH Department-Kulliyah of Dentistry
International Islamic University Malaysia
Jl. Sultan Ahmad Shah
Kuantan 
Pahang
Tlp.+60179040567, ext: 4898

SUSI <sukmasari@iium.edu.my> Tue, Nov 7, 2023 at 9:29 AM
To: "drg.risyandi@unimus.ac.id" <drg.risyandi@unimus.ac.id>

---------- Forwarded message ---------
From: SUSI <sukmasari@iium.edu.my>
Date: Sat, Jun 4, 2022 at 12:42 PM
Subject: Re: 108642-PJBS-ANSI - Check Final Proof
To: Science Alert <support@scialert.com>

On Thu, Jun 2, 2022 at 7:03 PM Science Alert <support@scialert.com> wrote:

Dear Dr. Susi Sukmasari

This is with regard to your submitted manuscript, 108642-PJBS-ANSI, titled Antimicrobial activity of Î²-
sitosterol isolated from Kalanchoe tomentosa leaves against Staphylococcus aureus and Klebsiella 
pneumonia, submitted to Pakistan Journal of Biological Sciences on 02 February, 2022 for consideration as a 
Research Article.

Production Department has prepared final proof of your above mentioned manuscript for publication in the 
coming issue of Pakistan Journal of Biological Sciences. 

You may please download the final proof of your article for final checking after log in to your account with 
User ID: sukmasari@iium.edu.my. 

If you have forgot your password, you may retrieve your password from the following link by providing your 
User ID sukmasari@iium.edu.my.
  
http://scialert.com/forgot_password.php

Please check the final proof carefully and provide us the list of corrections by replying this email. Please note 
that after this step this article will be published immediately and we will not be in a position to modify any part 
of the paper later on. 

It is therefore, requested to please submit list of corrections within next two days. If the provided final proof is 
suitable and you did not find any mistake in this final proof, please send us email and write that you are 
satisfied with the provided final proof. 

Your quick response will help us to publish your article in the coming issue. 

We look forward to hearing from you.

Regard
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Academic Editor
Pakistan Journal of Biological Sciences

Dear Editor,

There are corrections from us. Please proceed the publication accordingly 

Regards,

Asst. Prof. Susi Sukmasari
PDPH Department-Kulliyah of Dentistry
International Islamic University Malaysia
Jl. Sultan Ahmad Shah
Kuantan 
Pahang
Tlp.+60179040567, ext: 4898
[Quoted text hidden]
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Risyandi Risyandi <drg.risyandi@unimus.ac.id>

Fwd: 108642-PJBS-ANSI - Check Final Proof
SUSI <sukmasari@iium.edu.my> Tue, Nov 7, 2023 at 9:29 AM
To: "drg.risyandi@unimus.ac.id" <drg.risyandi@unimus.ac.id>

---------- Forwarded message ---------
From: SUSI <sukmasari@iium.edu.my>
Date: Sat, Jun 4, 2022 at 12:42 PM
Subject: Re: 108642-PJBS-ANSI - Check Final Proof
To: Science Alert <support@scialert.com>

On Thu, Jun 2, 2022 at 7:03 PM Science Alert <support@scialert.com> wrote:

Dear Dr. Susi Sukmasari

This is with regard to your submitted manuscript, 108642-PJBS-ANSI, titled Antimicrobial activity of Î²-
sitosterol isolated from Kalanchoe tomentosa leaves against Staphylococcus aureus and Klebsiella 
pneumonia, submitted to Pakistan Journal of Biological Sciences on 02 February, 2022 for consideration as a 
Research Article.

Production Department has prepared final proof of your above mentioned manuscript for publication in the 
coming issue of Pakistan Journal of Biological Sciences. 

You may please download the final proof of your article for final checking after log in to your account with 
User ID: sukmasari@iium.edu.my. 

If you have forgot your password, you may retrieve your password from the following link by providing your 
User ID sukmasari@iium.edu.my.
  
http://scialert.com/forgot_password.php

Please check the final proof carefully and provide us the list of corrections by replying this email. Please note 
that after this step this article will be published immediately and we will not be in a position to modify any part 
of the paper later on. 

It is therefore, requested to please submit list of corrections within next two days. If the provided final proof is 
suitable and you did not find any mistake in this final proof, please send us email and write that you are 
satisfied with the provided final proof. 

Your quick response will help us to publish your article in the coming issue. 

We look forward to hearing from you.

Regard
Academic Editor
Pakistan Journal of Biological Sciences

Dear Editor,

There are corrections from us. Please proceed the publication accordingly 
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Regards,

Asst. Prof. Susi Sukmasari
PDPH Department-Kulliyah of Dentistry
International Islamic University Malaysia
Jl. Sultan Ahmad Shah
Kuantan 
Pahang
Tlp.+60179040567, ext: 4898
[Quoted text hidden]
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Risyandi Risyandi <drg.risyandi@unimus.ac.id>

Fwd: 108642-PJBS-ANSI - Urgent Request for Payment
SUSI <sukmasari@iium.edu.my> Tue, Nov 7, 2023 at 9:28 AM
To: "drg.risyandi@unimus.ac.id" <drg.risyandi@unimus.ac.id>

---------- Forwarded message ---------
From: SUSI <sukmasari@iium.edu.my>
Date: Mon, Apr 4, 2022 at 5:03 PM
Subject: Re: 108642-PJBS-ANSI - Urgent Request for Payment
To: Science Alert <support@scialert.com>

On Mon, Apr 4, 2022 at 3:27 PM Science Alert <support@scialert.com> wrote:

Dear Dr. Susi Sukmasari

This is with regard to your submitted manuscript, 108642-PJBS-ANSI, titled Antimicrobial activity of Î²-
sitosterol isolated from Kalanchoe tomentosa leaves against Staphylococcus aureus and Klebsiella 
pneumonia, submitted to Pakistan Journal of Biological Sciences on 02 February, 2022 for consideration as a 
Research Article.

The above-mentioned manuscript has been finally accepted by the Reviewer for publication in Pakistan 
Journal of Biological Sciences as Research Article.

Now the article is pending due to the payment of the Article Processing Cost.  If you are responsible to pay 
the Article Processing Charges of this article, please download the invoice from the following link and pay the 
APC IMMEDIATELY. 

https://scialert.com/ems/printinv.php?id=108642

Your quick response will help us to publish your article in the coming issue. 

We look forward to hearing from you.

Regard
Jasmine Wulf
Communication Manager
Pakistan Journal of Biological Sciences

Dear Jasmine,

I am confused with more than one email regarding this payment.

I received this email from academic editor (Abdul Hakim):

Please use the following information to send payment via Western Union:
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Receiver First Name: Sayera
Receiver Last Name: Zainab
City: Faisalabad
Country: Pakistan
Cell: +92 321 720 8888

Just want to confirm, Is it right to send to the individual name as above?

Regards,

Asst. Prof. Susi Sukmasari
PDPH Department-Kulliyah of Dentistry
International Islamic University Malaysia
Jl. Sultan Ahmad Shah
Kuantan 
Pahang
Tlp.+60179040567, ext: 4898

--

السلام علیكم و رحمة الله و بركات ه

Regards,

Asst. Prof. Susi Sukmasari
PDPH Department-Kulliyah of Dentistry
International Islamic University Malaysia
Jl. Sultan Ahmad Shah
Kuantan 
Pahang
Tlp.+60179040567, ext: 4898
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Risyandi Risyandi <drg.risyandi@unimus.ac.id>

Fwd: 108642-PJBS-ANSI - Urgent Request for Payment
2 messages

SUSI <sukmasari@iium.edu.my> Tue, Nov 7, 2023 at 9:30 AM
To: "drg.risyandi@unimus.ac.id" <drg.risyandi@unimus.ac.id>

---------- Forwarded message ---------
From: SUSI <sukmasari@iium.edu.my>
Date: Mon, Apr 4, 2022 at 4:57 PM
Subject: Re: 108642-PJBS-ANSI - Urgent Request for Payment
To: Science Alert <support@scialert.com>

On Mon, Apr 4, 2022 at 12:59 PM SUSI <sukmasari@iium.edu.my> wrote:

On Mon, Apr 4, 2022 at 12:43 PM Science Alert <support@scialert.com> wrote:

Dear Dr. Susi Sukmasari

This is with regard to your submitted manuscript, 108642-PJBS-ANSI, titled Antimicrobial activity of Î²-
sitosterol isolated from Kalanchoe tomentosa leaves against Staphylococcus aureus and Klebsiella 
pneumonia, submitted to Pakistan Journal of Biological Sciences on 02 February, 2022 for consideration as a 
Research Article.

The above-mentioned manuscript has been finally accepted by the Reviewer for publication in Pakistan 
Journal of Biological Sciences as Research Article.

Now the article is pending due to the payment of the Article Processing Cost.  If you are responsible to pay 
the Article Processing Charges of this article, please download the invoice from the following link and pay the 
APC IMMEDIATELY. 

https://scialert.com/ems/printinv.php?id=108642

Your quick response will help us to publish your article in the coming issue. 

We look forward to hearing from you.

Regard
Jasmine Wulf
Communication Manager
Pakistan Journal of Biological Sciences

--

Dear Jasmine

I emailed for clarification for payment, I need account bank name and number, but they didn't reply until now.
 Please guide us to do the payment.
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Regards,

Asst. Prof. Susi Sukmasari
PDPH Department-Kulliyah of Dentistry
International Islamic University Malaysia
Jl. Sultan Ahmad Shah
Kuantan 
Pahang
Tlp.+60179040567, ext: 4898

Dear Jasmine,

I am confusing with more than one email regarding this payment.

I received this email from academic editor:

Note: This information is valid only for 36 hours. So please take necessary on a priority basis.

Dear Author

Please use the following information to send payment via Western Union:

Receiver First Name: Sayera
Receiver Last Name: Zainab
City: Faisalabad
Country: Pakistan
Cell: +92 321 720 8888

Please send us the payment receipt when you paid the publication cost.

Regard
Abd al Hakim
Academic Editor
Science Alert

Is it right to send to the individual name as aboce?

Regards,

Asst. Prof. Susi Sukmasari
PDPH Department-Kulliyah of Dentistry
International Islamic University Malaysia
Jl. Sultan Ahmad Shah
Kuantan 
Pahang
Tlp.+60179040567, ext: 4898

--
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Regards,

Asst. Prof. Susi Sukmasari
PDPH Department-Kulliyah of Dentistry
International Islamic University Malaysia
Jl. Sultan Ahmad Shah
Kuantan 
Pahang
Tlp.+60179040567, ext: 4898

SUSI <sukmasari@iium.edu.my> Tue, Nov 7, 2023 at 9:31 AM
To: "drg.risyandi@unimus.ac.id" <drg.risyandi@unimus.ac.id>

---------- Forwarded message ---------
From: SUSI <sukmasari@iium.edu.my>
Date: Mon, Apr 4, 2022 at 12:59 PM
Subject: Re: 108642-PJBS-ANSI - Urgent Request for Payment
To: Science Alert <support@scialert.com>
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